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Ozark, MO 65721 Category: Meeting Items

Prepared By: Madi Hires
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Sponsors:

MEETING ATTACHMENTS (ID # 5073) DOC ID: 5073

Meeting Attachments

ATTACHMENTS:

° Catholic Charities of Southern Missouri - Emergency Solutions Grant ~ (PDF)

° County Clerk - 2nd Qtr Report (PDF)

° Highway Contract Amendment - Roadway Signs & Equipment (PDF)
° Newman Signs, Inc. - Fully Executed Amendment (PDF)

° Osburn Associates, Inc. - Fully Executed Amendment (PDF)

° Vulcan Signs - Fully Executed Amendment (PDF)

° EMA - 2nd Qtr Report (PDF)
° Highway - 2nd Qtr Report (PDF)
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Date July 9, 2019

MlSSOllI‘l Housmg Development Commission
ATTN: Communlty Initiatives Department -
920 Main Street, Suite 1400

~ Kansas City, MO 64105

RE: Cathohc Charities of Southern M1ssour1 s Emergency Solutions Grant Apphcatlon (ESG)
FY 2020 ' . .

The Christian County Commission supports the apphcatmn of Catholic Charltles of
Southern Missouri to the Missouri Housing Development Commission for fundmg the
Emergency Solutlons Grant (ESG) for the 2020 homeless preventlon grant in Christian
County _

The Chrlstlan County Commission works with many of the same clients served by Catholic
Charities of Southern Missouri i ina collaborattve manner as well as we share resources and
referrals.

Catholic Char1t1es of Southern Missouri has been a strong provider in our County for
: households that have been strugghng with chronic homelessness or are at risk of
homelessness for several years.

I know you will consider this app11cat1on on its merits, and I thank you for your prompt and
thoughtful consideration of the matter.

Sincerely,
Mike Robertson Ralph Phillips Hosea Bilyeu
Eastern Commissioner Presiding Commissioner Western Commissioner
Website: www.christiancountymo.gov - ‘ Email: countycommission@chﬁsﬁancountymo.gov
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2019 2ND QUARTER REPORT OF THE COUNTY CLERK

APRIL & MAY:

April 29, 2019, Presented the County Precinct Report

May 1, 2019, Prepared and submitted Form 40: Statement of Railroad and Utility
Property to the State Tax Commission.

May 1, 2019, Prepared Local Railroad and Utility Tax Book for all the Taxing Districts.
May 2, 2019, Swore in Shannon Peirce for the LERF Board. ’

May 7-9, 2019, Urban Board Conference of the County Clerks and Election Authorities.
May 13, 2019, Swore in Justin Arnold for the E-911 Board replacing Tim Clothier.

May 13 (5:30p.m.) - 15, 2019, Strategic Planning for Nixa School District.

May 20, 2019, Swore in Susie Ballard for LERF Board.

May 23, 2019, Prepared the Board of Equalization Newspaper Notice

May 1 —July 10, 2019; Eryn Burton, Madi Hires and Chelsey Sullins processed and filed
639 voter registrants. This does not include the number of address changes, names
changes and deletions that were processed in elections and filed. In addition, the ERIC
Report is ongoing and continually being processed. .=

Norma Ryan pays all the bills for the county and reconciles all accounts.

Norma Ryan completed and submitted the reimbursement for the Assessor’s Quarterly
Report. ,

Norma Ryan preprocesses all new voter registration cards received by mail each day.

Paula Brumfield continues to process bi-weekly payroll and administer monthly benefits

meetings with all eligible employees.

Paula Brumfield prepared information for a total of 37 employees for the months of
April, May and June for the following: 8 new hires, 12 terminations and 17 new
employee insurance meetings.

June 6, 2019, Presented and attended the Rejuvenate Women'’s Conference with the
Ozark Chamber of Commerce.

June 6, 2019, Swore in David Hoover with the University of MO.

June 24, 2019, County Clerk prepared and submitted the Annual Report of the County

Clerk to the Missouri Department of Elementary and Secondary Schools. This report was

for all 13 school districts.
County Clerk worked with Emergency Management Director Phil Amtower Emergency
Operation Plan for the Polling locations
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e June 30, 2019, Paula Brumfield completed the second quarter 941 reports for the
Federal Government. Ms. Brumfield paid the State unemployment quarterly report as
well as CERF, LAGERS, and insurance.

e Each month Chief Deputy Payroll Clerk Paula Brumfield prepares the grant
reimbursement invoice for the Sheriff's Department, Juvenile Department, Emergency
Management, and the Prosecutor’s Office. All grant payroll reimbursements are
submitted in a timely manner.

e Paula Brumfield prepared and submitted the monthly collection reports of the County
Collector to the Department of Revenue and the State Tax Commission for the months
of: May and June.

Deputy Clerks: Eryn Burton, Madi Hires and Chelsey Sullins daily serve the public by issuing ATV
Permits, swearing in numerous notaries, providing Public Service Requests, Auctioneer licenses,
and assisting all those that call or come to the Clerk’s Office for help. In addition, they process
many reports provided by the Circuit Courts, Secretary of State, Department of Revenue, -
Library and Family Services. o

The listing below is a record of revenue received in the County Clerk’s Office for licenses, public
service requests and copies:

Total 2019 APRIL 2019 MAY 2019 JUNE
Total '

# | Amount # | Amount # | Amount # | Amount
ATV $ 15.00 EACH $ 1,035.00 29 | $435.00 21 |$315.00| | 19| $285.00
Notary $ 6.00 EACH S 456.00 23 | $138.00 32 | $192.00 21| $126.00
Auction $52.00 3|$ 156.00 0 0 2 | $104.00 1| $52.00
Public Service Req. $ 10.00 2 1S 2000 0 0 2|5 2000 0
Copies 10 cents per page S 0.00 0 0 0 0 0
Total $573.00 $631.00 $ 463.00
GRAND TOTAL $ $ 1,667.00

Eryn Burton, Madi Hires and Chelsey Sullins are responsible for collecting all fees listed above
and providing these services to our citizens.
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CONTRACT AMENDMENT NO. 1

This amendment is made to the Annual Contract for RoadWay Signs & Equipment, previously executed by
and between Christian County, Missouri and Newman Signs, Inc., Osburn Associates, Inc. and Vulcan Signs
on January 12, 2017 with subsequent renewals on December 4, 2017 and December 20, 2018.

It is mutually understood and agreed by and between the undersigned contracting parties to amend that
previously executed agreement as follows:

- Pricing to be altered based on increased price of aluminum. New costs supplied by all active
vendors. Amended pricing summary is attached. .

All other terms and conditions that are not hereby amended are to remain in full force and effect.

Mike Robertson Ralph Phillips ¥ Hosea Bilyeu

Eastern Commissioner Presiding Commissioner Western Commissioner

7/2/ 9

Authorized Representative Date

Website: www.christiancountymo.gov . Email: countycommission@christiancountymo.gov
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Krista Raleigh

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

All:

Miranda Beadles <mbeadles@christiancountymo.gov>
Monday, July 8, 2019 8:49 AM
countycommission@christiancountymo.gov

‘Krista Raleigh'; ‘Amy Dent'

Contract Amendment - Roadway Signs Annual Contract
Screenshot_070819_084108_AM.jpg; BID TAB - PRICE ADJ.xlsx

| have an item on Thursday’s agenda for an amendment to our existing annual contract for roadway signs. The
vendors have been in contact with us regarding the increase in aluminum costs and that they were unable to provide
materials at the same price as bid in 2016. Per our contract, we can modify the existing through a formal contract
amendment (see attached). We contacted each vendor and asked them to provide their new pricing for the duration
of 2019. Also attached is a summary of the proposed pricing.

While we only have 5 months left on this contract if the amendment is approved, our sign purchases are typically
large and | did not want to risk exceeding our limits set by State Statute.

If you have any questions/comments, I'd be happy to answer before or at the meeting on Thursday.

Thanks,

Miranda Beadles, P.E.
Highway Administrator

417.582.4394




R1-1 STOP 30X30 EA $25.93 $11.84 530,00 $9.19 $35.67 $14.75
R1-2 YIELD 30X30X30 EA $14.41 $5.95 $19.69 $5.51 $20.90 $9.66
R5-1 DO NOT ENTER 30X30 EA $27.08 $11.64 $32.81 $8.19 $35.77 $14.76
R2-1 SPEED LIMIT {XX) 24X30 EA $21.65 $9.31 $26.25 §7.35 $29.82 $12.72
R4-1 DO NOT PASS 24X30 EA $21.65 $9.31 5£26,25 $7.35 $29.82 $12.72
R12-1 WEIGHT LIMIT (XX) TON 24X30 EA $21.65 $9.31 526.25 $7.35 £$29.82 $12.72
R8-3 NO PARKING (SYMBOL) 24X24 EA $18.25 $8.08 $21.00 $5.88 $16.45 $14.48
R8-3A NO PARKING 24 X‘30 EA $22.74 $151 $26.25 $7.35 $29.82 $18.99
R1-3P ALL WAY (PLAQUE) 18X6 EA $4.11 $9.31 $3.94 $1.10 $9.61 $5.79
R6-2 ONE WAY 24X30 EA $21.65 $18.63 $26.25 $7.35 $29.82 $12.72
R11-2 ROAD CLOSED 48X 30 EA $43.31 §23.29 $52.50 $14,70 5§53.52 $20.77
R11-3 ROAD CLOSED ~ LOCAL TRAFFIC ONLY 60x 30 EA $54.14 $6.99 $65.63 $18.38 $74.45 $24.79
R4-7C NARROW KEEP RIGHT 18X 30 EA $16.27 $6.99 $19.69 $5.51 $23.87 $10.68
R4-8C NARROW KEEP LEFT 18X 30 EA $16.27 $6.99 $19.69 $5.51 £23.87 $10.68
R8-3DP ON BRIDGE {PLAQUE) 24X18 EA $12.99 $5.59 $15.75 $4.41 $25.79 $14.38
RX-X TYPICAL REGULATORY SIGN {NOT ALREADY LISTED) 18X 24 EA $12.99 $5.50 $15.75 $4.41 $20.32 $§7.52
RX-X TYPICAL REGULATORY SIGM (NOT ALREADY LISTED) 24X30 EA $21.65 $9.31 $26.25 $7.35 $29.82 §12.72
RX-X TYPICAL REGULATORY SIGN (NOT ALREADY LISTED) 30X30 EA $21.65 $9.31 $32.81 $9.15 ) $35.77 $12.76
RX-X TYPICAL REGULATORY SIGN (NOT ALREADY LISTED) 36X36 EA $21.65 $9.31 $47.25 $13.23 $48.89 $19.27
“WARNING:SIGNS .- VULCAN SIGNS OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. NEWMAN SIGNS
P [ v froems | o | vevpwes | neror | wewoue | pczow
W1-2 (R) 45° RIGHT CURVE (SYMBOL) 36X36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
W1-2 (L) 45° LEFT CURVE (SYMBOL) 36X 36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 $13.23 548,82 $19.21
W11 {R) 90° LEFT CURVE (SYMBOL) 36X36 EA $38.93 $16.77 547,25 513.23 548.82 $19.21
Wi1-11(L) 90° LEFT CURVE (SYMBOL) 36X 36 EA $38.98 $16.77 547,25 $13.23 $43.82 $19.21
W1-3 {R) RIGHT REVERSE TURN {SYMBOL) 36X 36 EA 5$38.98 $16.77 $47.25 513.23 $48.82 $19.21
W1-3 (L) LEFT REVERSE TURN (SYMBOL) 36X36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 513.23 $48.82 $18.21
W1-5 (R} RIGHT WINDING ROAD (SYMBOL) 36X36 EA $38.98 816.77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
Wi1-5 (L) LEFT WINDING ROAD {SYMBOL) 36X36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
W1-4 (R) RIGHT REVERSE CURVE (SYMBOL) 36X36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
Wi1-4iL) LEFT REVERSE CURVE {SYMBOL) 36X36 EA $38.98 , $16.27 $47.25 513.23 $48.82 $19.21
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Wi-8 CHEVRON 18X24 EA $12.99 $5.59 $15.75 $4.41 $20.32 $9.48
w3-1 STOP AHEAD 30X30 EA $28.72 $12.79 $32.81 $9.19 $38.49 $21.35
W5-1 ROAD NARROWS 36X36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
W5-3 ONE LANE BRIDGE 36X 36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
wis-1 IMPASSABLE DURING HIGH WATER 30X 30 EA $27.08 81165 $32.81 $9.19 $46.59 $25.98
wa-11 UNEVEN LANES 36X36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
wa-19 FLOOD GAUGE 12X72 EA $25.99 $11.18 $31.50 $6.00 $33.99 $29.82
W11-2 PEDESTRIAN CROSSING 30X30 EA $27.08 $1165 $32.81 $9.19 $35.77 $14.76
wa-4p CROSS TRAFFIC DOES NOT STOP (PLAQUE) 24%12 EA $8.66 $327 $10.50 $2.94 $15.55 $11.75
W8-2 DIP 30X 30 EA $27.08 $11.65 $32.81 $9.19 $35.77 $14.76
w8-3 PAVEMENT ENDS 36X36 EA $38.98 $16.77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
w8-7 LOOSE GRAVEL 36X36 £A $38.98 $16,77 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
w8-1 BUMP 30X 30 EA $27.08 $11.65 $32.81 $9.19 $35.77 $14.76
W14-1 NO QUTLET 30X30 EA $27.08 $11.65 $32.81 $9.19 $35.77 $14.76
W2-4 “T* INTERSECTION (SYMBOL) 30X%30 EA $27.08 $11.65 $32.81 $9.19 $35.77 $14.76
w2-2 MINOR “T” INTERSECTION {SYMBOL) 30X30 EA $27.08 $11.65 $32.81 $9.19 $35.77 $14.76
W2-1 CROSSROAD (SYMBOL) 30%30 EA $27.08 $11.65 $32.81 $9,19 $35.77 $14.76
W17 DOUBLE ARROW 48X 24 EA $34.65 $14,90 $42,00 $11.76 $44.01 $17.54
W1-6 ARROW 48X 24 EA $34.65 $14.90 $42.00 $11.76 $44.01 $17.54
WX-X TYPICAL WARNING SIGN (NOT ALREADY LISTED) 30X 30 EA $27.08 $11.65 $32.81 $9.19 $35.77 $14.76
WX-X TYPICAL WARNING SIGN (NOT ALREADY LISTED) 36X 36 EA $27.08 $11.65 $47.25 $13.23 $48.82 $19.21
F : VULCAN SIGNS QOSBURN ASSQCIATES, INC. NEWMAN SIGNS

NEW (PANEL+ | FACEONLY | NEW(PANEL+ | FACEONLY | NEW(PANEL+ | FACEONLY
FACE) COST cosT FACE) COST cosT FACE) COST COST
531 SCHOOL BUS STOP AHEAD {(SYMBOL) 36X 36 EA $52.49 $33.22 $56.25 $29.16 $72.93 $45.25
$1-1 SCHOOL CROSSING 36X36 EA $51.32 $3263 $56.25 $29.16 $72.49 $41.96

VULCAN SIGNS OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. NEWMAN SIGNS

NEW (PANEL+ [ FACEONLY | NEW (PANEL+ | FACEONLY | NEW (PANEL+ | FACE ONLY
FACE) COST cosT FACE) COST cosT FACE) COST cosT
CUSTOM CHRISTIAN COUNTY MAINTENANCE ENDS 18X 18 EA $12.89 $7.24 $11.81 $331 $21.15 $13.04
CUSTOM NO DUMPING 18X 18 EA $12.89 $7.24 $11.81 $3.31 $21.15 $13.04
CusTOM TYPICAL CUSTOM SIGN {(NOT ALREADY LISTED) 18X 18 EA $12.89 $7.24 $11.81 $3.31 $21.15 $13.04




VULCAN SIGNS

OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.

NEWMAN SIGNS

NEW (PANEL + FACE ONLY

NEW (PANEL + FACE ONLY

NEW (PANEL + FACE ONLY

FACE) COST cosT FACE) COST cosT FACE) COST cosT

OM-3(L) DITCH MARKER (LEFT) 12X36 £A $12.99 $5.59 $15.75 $4.41 $20.28 $9.44
OM-3(R) DITCH MARKER (RIGHT) 12X36 EA $12.99 $5.59 $15.75 $4.41 $20.28 $9.44
OM-3(C) DITCH MARKER {CENTER) 12X 36 EA $12.99 $5.59 $15.75 $4.41 $20.28 $9.44
OM1-1 OBJECT MARKER {Y/Y) 18X18 EA $20.07 NO BID $11.81 $3.31 $23.77 NO B(D
OM1-2 QBJECT MARKER (B/Y) 18X18 EA $20.07 NO BID $11.81 $3.31 $21.27 NO BID
OM1-3 OBJECT MARKER {Y) 18X18 EA $12.46 $4.18 $11.81 $3.31 $23.77 NO BID
OM4-1 OBJECT MARKER {R/R) 18X 18 EA $20.07 NOBID $11.81 $3.31 $25.56 NO BID
OMA4-2 OBIECT MARKER (B/R) 18X 18 EA $20.07 NOBID $11.81 $3.31 $21.14 NO BID
OM4-3 OBJECT MARKER (R) 18X 18 EA $12.43 $4.18 $11.81 $3.31 $24.80 NO BID

..STREET NAME SIGN VULCAN SIGNS OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. NEWMAN SIGNS

NEW (PANEL + FACE ONLY

NEW (PANEL + FACE ONLY

NEW (PANEL + FACE ONLY

FACE) COST cosT FACE) COST cosT FACE) COST COST
D3-1 STREET NAME SIGN 8x18 EA $9.60 $4.18 $13.25 $6.48 $20.13 $16.45
03-1 STREET NAME SIGN 8X24 EA $13.44 $5.56 $17.68 $8.64 $24.12 $18.88
D3-1 STREET NAME SIGN 8X30 EA $16.92 $6.94 $22.09 $10.80 $26.66 $20.89
03-1 STREET NAME SIGN 8X36 EA $20.02 $8.33 $26.50 $12.96 $30.52 $22.92
031 STREET NAME SIGN 8X42 EA $23.48 $9.74 $30.93 $15.12 $33.21 $25.84
D3-1 STREET NAME SIGN 12X18 EA $6.15 $3.13 $19.88 $9.72 $24.94 $19.69
D3-1 STREET NAME SIGN 12X 24 EA $9.93 $3.70 $26.50 $12.96 $29.45 $22.64
D3-1 STREET NAME SIGN 12X 30 EA $11.71 $4.64 $33.13 $16.20 $34.39 $26.02
D3-1 STREET NAME SIGN 12X 36 EA $14.01 $5.56 $39.75 $19.44 $38.91 $28.97
D3-1 STREET NAME SIGN 12X42 EA $16.34 $6.49 $46.38 $22.68 $43.84 $32.34

VULCAN SIGNS OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. NEWMAN SIGNS
UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 8Xx18 EA $334 $2.68 $5.59
N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 8X24 EA $4.18 $3.54 $6.63
N/A BLANK {METAL ONLY) 12X36 FA $8.76 $7.95 $11.85
N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY} 18X 18 EA $6.54 $5.96 $9.49
N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 12X18 EA $4.40 $3.98 $7.15




N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 12X 24 EA $5.86 $5.30 $8.72
N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 18X 24 EA $8.19 $7.95 $11.85
N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 18X 36 EA $11.78 $11.93 $16.01
N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 24X 24 EA $10.96 $10.60 $14.97
N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 30X 30 EA $1691 $16.56 $22.00
N/A BLANK (METAL ONLY) 30X30X30 EA $8.53 $9.94 $11.72
St ; VULCAN SIGNS OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. NEWMAN SIGNS
UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
N/A 218 U-CHANNEL POST 4FT EA $7.09 NO BID NO BID
N/A 2 LB U-CHANNEL POST 8FT EA $14.16 NO BID NO BID
N/A 2 LB U-CHANNEL POST 10FT EA $17.71 NO BID NG BID
N/A 318 U-CHANNEL POST 4FT EA $10.62 NOBID NO BID
N/A 3 LB U-CHANNEL POST RFT EA $21.26 NO BID NO 8ID
N/A i 3 LB U-CHANNEL POST 10FT EA $26.57 NO BID NO BID
N/A SUPER LOK 90° CROSSPIECE BRACKET {(EXTRUDED) 990X EA $4.48 $4.25 NO BID
N/A SUPER LOK 90° BRACKET (EXTRUDED) 91UX-0L90 EA $3.59 54.25 NOBID
N/A SUPER LOK 180" BRACKET (EXTRUDED) 91UX-NU180 |  EA $3.59 $4.25 NO BID
N/A SUPER LOK 90° CROSSPIECE BRACKET (EXTRUDED) 12N £A $11.31 ) $9.25 NO BID
N/A SUPER LOK 90° BRACKET (EXTRUDED) 121N, EA $11.31 $9.25 NO BID
N/A SUPER LOK 180° BRACKET (EXTRUDED) 121N, EA $11.31 $9.25 NO BID
N/A SLIP SAFE BRACKET U-CHANNEL EA $76.87 NO BID NO BID
VULCAN SIGNS OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. NEWMAN SIGNS
UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

N/A HIP/PS GREEN ROLL 8" X50YD EA $160.40 $121.00 $164.59
N/A " HIP/PS GREEN ROLL 12" X50YD EA $254.10 $181.50 $246.89

B SERIES 6" UPPERCASE LETTER, HIP 6 EA $15.67 $22.54 $17.31

B SERIES 4" UPPERCASE LETTER, HIP g EA $12.04 $20.21 $13.28

B SERIES 4” LOWERCASE LETTER, HIP 4 EA $12.04 $20.21 $13.28

B SERIES 3“ LOWERCASE LETTER, HIP 3 EA $9.62 $19.39 $11.82




YULCAN SIGNS OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. NEWMAN SIGNS
UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
N/A TYPE 1 BARRICADE 24X36 EA $66.40 NO BID NO BID
N/A TYPE 2 BARRICADE 24X36 EA $75.80 NO BID NO BID
N/A TYPE 3 BARRICADE 48X 60 EA $208.44 NO BID NO BID
N/A 36" ROLL UP SIGN, REFLECTIVE, RIBS 36X36 EA $84.32 NO BID $74,83
N/A 36" ROLL UP SIGN, MESH, RIBS 36X36 EA $41.21 NO BID NO 8ID
N/A ROLL UP/PORTABLE SIGN STANDS COMPACT EA $160.30 NO BID $94.23
N/A ROLL UP/PORTABLE SIGN STANDS MID-SIZE EA $246.75 NOBID $96.62
N/A DELINEATCR POSTS 48 EA $17.58 NO BID NOBID
N/A DELINEATOR POST BASE STANDARD EA $15.12 NO BID NQO BID
N/A REFLECTIVE TRAFFIC CONES 36 EA $31.92 NOBID $21.92
N/A STOP/SLOW PADDLES 4-8FT EA $31,93 NO BID NO BID
TELESCOPING

N/A WARNING LIGHTS STANDARD EA $32.71 NO 8iD $14.79
N/A FLAGS STANDARD EA $5.02 NG BID $3.35

N/A DRUM W/ BASE 36 EA $80.34 NO 8ID NO BID
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11 July 2019

CONTRACT AMENDMENT NO. 1

This amendment is made to the Annual Contract for Roadway Signs & Equipment, previously executed by
and between Christian County, Missouri and Newman Signs, Inc., Osburn Associates, Inc. and Vulcan Signs
on January 12, 2017 with subsequent renewals on December 4, 2017 and December 20, 2018.

It is mutually understood and agreed by and between the undersigned contracting parties to amend that
previously executed agreement as follows:

Pricing to be altered based on increased price of aluminum. New costs supplied by all active
vendors. Amended pricing summary is attached.

All other terms and conditions that are not hereby amended are to remain in full force and effect.
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Website: www christiancountymo.gov Email: countycommission(@christiancountymo.gov
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Presiding Commissioner

COMMISSION Hosea Bilyeu

100 W Church Street, Room 100 SR Commmtionet

Ozark, Missouri 63721

s CHDI{%TU\N COUNTY Ralph Phillips

s i e . el Mike Robertson

11 July 2019

CONTRACT AMENDMENT NO. 1

This amendment is made to the Annual Contract for Roadway Signs & Equipment, previously executed by
and between Christian County, Missouri and Newman Signs, Inc., Osburn Associates, Inc. and Vulcan Signs
on January 12, 2017 with subsequent renewals on December 4, 2017 and December 20, 2018.

It is mutually understood and agreed by and between the undersigned contracting parties to amend that
previously executed agreement as follows:

Pricing to be altered based on increased price of aluminum. New costs supplied by all active
vendors. Amended pricing summary is attached.

All other terms and conditions that are not hereby amended are to remain in full force and effect.

Mike Robertson Ralph Phillips Hosea Bilyeu
Eastern Commissioner Presiding Commissioner Western Commissioner
<

Authorized Representative

Website: www christiancountymo.gov Email: countycommission( christiancountymo.gov
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Eastern Commissioner

11 July 2019

CONTRACT AMENDMENT NO. 1

This amendment is made to the Annual Contract for Roadway Signs & Equipment, previously executed by
and between Christian County, Missouri and Newman Signs, Inc., Osburn Associates, Inc. and Vulcan Signs
on January 12, 2017 with subsequent renewals on December 4, 2017 and December 20, 2018.

It is mutually understood and agreed by and between the undersigned contracting parties to amend that
previously executed agreement as follows:

Pricing to be altered based on increased price of aluminum. New costs supplied by all active
vendors. Amended pricing summary is attached.

All other terms and conditions that are not hereby amended are to remain in full force and effect.

-

>, W S

Mike Robertson Ralph Phillips

Hosea Bilyeu

Eastern Commissioner Presiding Commissioner Western Commissioner

Authorized Representativ\ Date

David B. Beviacqua
General Manager
Vulcan Signs

Website: www.christiancountymo.gov Email: countycommission{@christiancountymo.gov
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o Meetings:
o Quarterly SMESO meeting
o RHSOC

® Vote on awards next week

o Quarterly LEPC

o MO CERT1
e Special Olympics in Clever
e 300-400 classes, Nixa School Admin :
* Propane emergencies in Highlandville i
* 300 Class Scheduled next week here

o 19 registered i‘
¢ lLocal Volunteer and Donations Management Aug 5-6 here
e CERT class scheduled for Oct 25, 26 and Nov 2
e Hazard Mitigation meeting

o Questionnaire filled out — one for us or one for each dept??

e First Responders Day
o Fire Safety Trailer
e Search and Rescue Class
e Sucker Days
e Integrated Warning Team, NWS
e Duck Race
e National Conference
e Speaking at the Region 7 LEPC conference in Omaha, NE August

e Tornado
o No disaster declaration
o Not enough for Public Assistance
o Finley River 5,400 for long term recovery

o ’




Highway Department Update
Q2 -20198

Road Maintenance

Regular maintenance: patching, brush cutting, weed spray
Annual Contract Resurfacing

Rain/Washout Response

Call Lists: Ci{72), Cll (117), Admin (79)

Future Work

Continuous grading, patching, cleaning ditches and culverts
Cl: Chip & Seal '

Nelson Mill Bridge Deck Epoxy Overlay, Cli

Joint Project, OSRD & Cli: Minnehaha & McCauley Signage

Contracts and Bids

Public bids
- Chadwick Road, Cl (90% Complete) »
- Annuals: Striping, Stormwater Pipes, Radios, Concrete

Future bids ,
- Renewals: Tires, Uniforms
- Bids: Signs, Salt, Heavy Equipment

Competitive Highway Bridge Program Grant, pending results (Fail 2019)
Collaborating on Riverside Bridge project with City and OSRD
Attending P&Z board meetings

Subdivision & Development Review: Infrastructure & Stormwater

-Reviewing driveway/access permits and utility permits with P&D

Tyler Software (Regs, Fixed Assets)
- Approved $1,596,890.44
Sales Tax Distributions: Complete thru Q2, 50% distributed




2019 Annual Resurfacing Projects — HMA

I, Sandstone Rd ' S RN C|, Clcar Spring Rd
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Cll, Creekside Rd

2019 Annual Resurfacing Projects — C/S

C

Il, Aven Springs Rd

Cll, Schupbach Rd

Hot Mix Summary
Common | Common Il
# of Roads 11 14
Miles - 9.22 451
Tons 11,900 5,600
S $647,000 $318,000
Chip & Seal
Common | Common Il
# of Roads 19 26
Miles 17.80 25.00
SY 209,000 282,000
) $398,000 $435,000
Rock to Pavement 11.3 miles 4.5 miles




2019 Construction Projects
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